
From:                                         Lorraine Cordell <lorraine32@blueyonder.co.uk>
Sent:                                           16 May 2014 16:27
To:                                               'martinjenkin@broadsuredirect.com'
Subject:                                     RE: Policy‐Simon‐Cordell
Attachments:                          36980157‐Jamie Macuire.doc; 36980158‐L Cordell.doc; 36980160‐Sheila Lewis.doc
 
Hi Martin
 
I got a call today and was told they needed 3 more invoices which I am sending over now.
 
I hope the invoices will not be used for anything as this could cause me trouble under the data protection law.
 
Regards
 
Simon
 

From: Lorraine Cordell [mailto:lorraine32@blueyonder.co.uk] 
Sent: 15 May 2014 13:04
To: 'Martin Jenkin'
Subject: RE: Policy-Simon-Cordell
 
Hi Martin
 
Simon had a letter from policy plan saying they were cancelling his policy the letter was dated 12/05/2014 and they said they were
cancelling seven days from the date of there letter . Not sure as to why as when Simon got your letter dated the 06/05/2014 we
sent the documents you asked for to policy plan. Please see attached documents which where posted to policy plan. Could you
please see as to the reason as why they are cancelling his policy please.
 
 
Regards
 
Simon
 
 
 



                                T-S-Enterprises 
109 Burncroft Av 

Enfield 

Middlesex 

EN3 7JQ 

07510 495262 

T-S-Enterprises 

1 

 

 

INVOICE N0: 36980157 
 
 

 

Jamie Mcuire 

39 Wilton Estate 

 

 

E8 1BD 

 

 

 
 
 
 AMOUNT DUE 

BMW 325i Full Service and replace Battery £195 

  

  

  

  

  

  

To Be Paid £195.00 

 
 
 
 
 
Date 12/05/2014 
 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

RE: Policy-Simon-Cordell->36980157-Jamie Macuire.docRE: Policy-Simon-Cordell->36980157-Jamie Macuire.doc



                                T-S-Enterprises 
109 Burncroft Av 

Enfield 

Middlesex 

EN3 7JQ 

07510 495262 

T-S-Enterprises 

2 

 

 

 

Oil and Oil Filter Replacement Done  

Brake Fluid Done  

Anti-freeze Coolant Done  

Windscreen Wash Done  

Power Steering Fluid Done  

Lights Done  

Windscreen Wipers Done  

Battery Condition Done Replaced with New 

Charging System   

Exhaust Condition  Done  

Tyre Tread and Pressure Done  

Full Brake Check Done  

Steering Check Done  

Shock Absorbers Check Done  

Suspension Check Done  

Auxiliary Drive Belt Check Done  

Wheel Alignment Check Done  

Wheel Bearing Check Done  

Wheel Balance  Done  

Brake Fluid Condition Done  

Replace Fuel Filter (Diesel)   

Replace Spark Plugs (Petrol) Done  

Replace Air Filter Done  

 



                                T-S-Enterprises 
109 Burncroft Av 

Enfield 

Middlesex 

EN3 7JQ 

07510 495262 

T-S-Enterprises 

1 

 

 

INVOICE N0: 36980158 
 
 

 

L Cordell 

23 Byron Terrace 

 

 

N9 7DG 

 

 

 
 
 
 AMOUNT DUE 

Ford Fiests Supply radio code 0147 £20.00 

  

  

  

  

  

  

To Be Paid  
£20.00 
 

 
  
 
 
Date 12/05/2014 
 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

RE: Policy-Simon-Cordell->36980158-L Cordell.docRE: Policy-Simon-Cordell->36980158-L Cordell.doc



                                T-S-Enterprises 
109 Burncroft Av 

Enfield 

Middlesex 

EN3 7JQ 

07510 495262 

T-S-Enterprises 

2 

 

 

 

Oil and Oil Filter Replacement   

Brake Fluid   

Anti-freeze Coolant   

Windscreen Wash   

Power Steering Fluid   

Lights   

Windscreen Wipers   

Battery Condition   

Charging System   

Exhaust Condition    

Tyre Tread and Pressure   

Full Brake Check   

Steering Check   

Shock Absorbers Check   

Suspension Check   

Auxiliary Drive Belt Check   

Wheel Alignment Check   

Wheel Bearing Check   

Wheel Balance    

Brake Fluid Condition   

Replace Fuel Filter (Diesel)   

Replace Spark Plugs (Petrol)   

Replace Air Filter   

 



                                T-S-Enterprises 
109 Burncroft Av 

Enfield 

Middlesex 

EN3 7JQ 

07510 495262 

T-S-Enterprises 

1 

 

 

INVOICE N0: 36980160 
 
 

 

Sheila Lewis 

5 Brook Crescent 

 

 

N9 ODJ 

 

 

 
 
 
 AMOUNT DUE 

PEUGEOT 206 1.1 ZEST 3, 2005 (Go and do check as wanting to buy car) £50.00 

  

Advised not to buy as she would need to replace back Shock Absorbers, and Front 

Exhaust as it had a small hole. Seller would not go lower on price. 

 

  

  

  

  

To Be Paid £50.00 
 

 
 
 
 
 
Date 13/05/2014 
 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

RE: Policy-Simon-Cordell->36980160-Sheila Lewis.docRE: Policy-Simon-Cordell->36980160-Sheila Lewis.doc



                                T-S-Enterprises 
109 Burncroft Av 

Enfield 

Middlesex 

EN3 7JQ 

07510 495262 

T-S-Enterprises 

2 

 

 

 

 

Oil and Oil Filter Replacement   

Brake Fluid   

Anti-freeze Coolant   

Windscreen Wash   

Power Steering Fluid   

Lights   

Windscreen Wipers   

Battery Condition   

Charging System   

Exhaust Condition    

Tyre Tread and Pressure   

Full Brake Check   

Steering Check   

Shock Absorbers Check   

Suspension Check   

Auxiliary Drive Belt Check   

Wheel Alignment Check   

Wheel Bearing Check   

Wheel Balance    

Brake Fluid Condition   

Replace Fuel Filter (Diesel)   

Replace Spark Plugs (Petrol)   

Replace Air Filter   

 


